Ordinance 14-69
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Memo to City Council
2014 City of North Royalton Street Rehabilitation Program
Page 30f 3

*** Asphalt Streets — Planing with Asphalt Overlay, ALTERNATE Asphalt Recycling (Wiltshire Road) ***

Contractor BASE BID AMOUNT ALTERNATE BID AMOUNT
1.) Specialized Construction, Inc. S 373,337.10 S 441,410.04

2.) Barbicas Construction Co., Inc. S 396,387.16 S 663,546.63

3.) Burton Scot Contractors, LLC S 382,523.04 (no bid)

Engineer’s Opinion of Probable Cost $ 424,167.03 S 486,232.74

(Please note that all bids include an 8% contingency.)

After extensive review of the submitted bids, the Engineering Department recommends Specialized Construction,
Inc., who is qualified to perform the work, the award of the lowest and best ALTERNATE bid of $ 441,410.04.

Finally, attached to this Memo is the complete Bid Tabulation for the 2014 City of North Royalton Street
Rehabilitation Program.

Attachments (3)



Ordinance 14-69
Exhibit A

City of North Royalton
2014 Asphalt Pavement Rehabilitation with Asphalt Overlay (Wiltshire Road)

BID TABULATION (Bid Opening held on Monday, April 28, 2014 at 12:00 PM)

NOTE: 80LD AED FONT INDICATES MATHEMATICAL ERROR
IN SUBMITTED BID - Gorrected value shown lo Qualily Bid

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

Lina No. i L Description

Pre & Post Construction Photograpghy, SPCL

Mobilization, CDOT ITEM 624

Asphalt Pavement Planing (3], ODOT I[TEM 254

Subbase Removal and Replacement, ODOT ITEM 304

Single Chip Seal, 3/8" thick, ODOT ITEM 422

Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course (1-1/2%), ODOT ITEM 448, Type 2, PGE4-22

Asphalt Concrete Surface Course (1-1/2"), ODOT ITEM 448, Type 1, PGE4-22

Spe

cialized Construction, Inc.

Barbicas Censtruction Co., Inc.

Linit

Total

Burton Scot Contractors, LLC
Tol;

$98,140.00]

Tack Coat for Surface Course {0.05 gal per S.Y.), ODOT ITEM 407

White Edge Line (4" wide), Type 1, ODOT ITEM 640

$136,800.00)

$23,000.00]
$33,636.00]

Centerline (Double Yellow), Type 1, ODOT ITEM 640

Canterlina (Dashed Yellow), Type 1, ODOT ITEM 640
Centerline (Solid-Dashed Yellow), Type 1, ODOT ITEM 640

24" Stop Line, Type 1, ODOT ITEM 640 $4
Maintaining Traffic, ODOT [TEM 614 ,000.
Asphalt Concrete for Maintaining Traffic, ODOT ITEM 614 X X
ITsmErag Sediment & Erosion Control, ODOT ITEM 207 $2,000.00 $$2,000.00
Miscellaneous Metals, SPGL §1.00) oo}
Monument Box Adjusted to Grade, ODOT ITEM 604 §1,400.00) $£300.00 .00]
CONSTRUCTION SUBTOTALY $345,682.50] $367,025.15) $354,188.00)
19 8% Contingency | $27,654.60 $29.362.01 $28,335.04}
CONSTRUCTION TOTAL| $373,337.10) $396,387.16 $382,523.04
"“*ALTERNATE BID ITEMS**
3-A__|Single Pass Asphalt Recyciing, SPCL S.Y. | 16,818 5.00) $84,090.00] $2.00] $33,636.00) (no bid) {no bid
3-A1_|Cyclogen & C8S-1, SPCL Gal. | 42,046 $2.00 $84,092.00] $6.00} $252,276.00 no bid| no bid)
3-A2 |Tack Coat for R led/Reclaimed Course, 0.075 gal per S.Y., ODOT [TEM 407 Gal 1,663 §1.00 $1,663.00) $2.50} $4,157.50 no bid] no bid]
6-A__|Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course (1-3/4%), ODOT ITEM 448, Type 2, PG64-22 C.Y.| 818 $130.00 $1086,340.00] $140.00] $114,520.00] [no bi no bid)
7-A__|Asphalt Concrete Surface Course (1-1/4"), ODOT ITEM 448, Type 1, PG64-22 C.Y. 640 $172.00 $110,080.00] $175.00)] $112,000.00) (no bid) (no bid)
CONSTRUCTION SUBTOTAL] $408,713.00) 86,617.25) {no bid)
19-A 8% Contingency | $32,697.0 $46,929.38) (no bid)
CONSTRUCTION TOTAL - ALTERNATE BID $486,232.74 $441,410.04 $633,546.63 (no bid)
(Jtems 1 thru 19 pius 3-A, 3-AT, 3-A2, 6-A, 7-A and 19-A,_excluding Hlems 3, 5, 6, 7 & 19)|

*** Lowest and Best Bid ***



