City of North Royalton

Mayor Robert A. Stefanik

Founded
1818

Service Department

Nick Cinquepalmi 440-582-3002
Service Director fax 440-582-3089
TO: Streets Committee — Gary Petrusky, Chairman
Larry Antoskiewicz, Vice Chair
John Nickell
FROM: Nick Cinquepalmi, Service Director
DATE: November 14, 2013
RE: 2014 Fuel Bid Recommendation

Please find attached the tally sheet from the Consortium Bid Opening for the 2014 Fuel Bid Program.

I am recommending that the City of North Royalton accept the bid of Ports Petroleum as the lowest and
best bid for the 2014 season with option of renewal for year 2015.

If there are any questions, do not hesitate to contact me. Thanks.

/acd
Encls

C: Mayor Robert Stefanik
Thomas A. Kelly, Law Director
Karen Fegan, Finance Director
Wards 3, 4,5, 6
Laura Haller, Legislative Director
File
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CONSORTIUM BID TABULATION:

SUPPLYING GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

Bid Opening: October 25,2013 9:00 a.m.

Present: Becki Burlingham, City of Brecksville, Wayne Peeples, Ports Petroleum Co., Terry Scheibe, Santmyer Oil Co. and Kip Tobin, Express Employment (representing Petroleum Traders)

Total Cost per Gallon Calculation: OPIS average
on order date + Differential + Taxes of $.001 Fed
LUST $.28 OH Tax $.0019 Oil Spill Tax

PETROLEUM TRADERS
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

(Using Sample
Data Provided on
Bid Form)

PORTS PETROLEUM
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

(Using Sample
Data Provided on
Bid Form)

GREAT LAKES PETROLEUM
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

(Using Sample Data
Provided on Bid
Form)

Price Differential (Add)

Total Cost/ Gallon

Price Differential (Add)

Total Cost/ Gallon

Price Differential (Add)

Total Cost/ Gallon

NO LEAD PREMIUM GASOLINE, 93 OCTANE w/10% Ethanol Blend

Transport 0.0099 3.5504 (0.0051) 3.5354 0.0000 3.5405
Tankwagon NO BID NO BID 0.0595 3.6000 0.0630 3.6035
Product Bid Marathon, BP, Global, Husky, etc. 93 Octane with Ethanol Various

Name & Location of Refiner BP/Cleveland Husky/Marathon/PBF/Ports Cleve. Various

NO LEAD MID-GRADE GASOLINE, 89 OCTANE w/ 10% Ethanol Blend

Transport 0.0203 3.4062 (0.0051) 3.3808 0.0000 3.3859
Tankwagon NO BID NO BID 0.0595 3.4454 0.0630 3.4489
Product Bid Marathon, BP, Global, Husky, etc. 89 Octane with Ethanol Various

Name & Location of Refiner BP/Cleveland Husky/Marathon/PBF/Ports Cleve. Various

NO LEAD REGULAR GRADE GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE, w/ 10% Ethanol Blend

Transport (0.0066) 3.2710 (0.0089) 3.2687 0.0000 3.2776
Tankwagon NO BID NO BID 0.0595 3.3371 0.0630 3.3406
Product Bid Marathon, BP, Global, Husky, etc. 87 Octane with Ethanol Various

Name & Location of Refiner BP/Cleveland Husky/Marathon/PBF/Ports Cleve. Various

ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 DIESEL

Transport (0.0036) 3.5314 (0.0051) 3.5299 (0.0050) 3.5300
Tankwagon NO BID NO BID 0.0695 3.6045 0.0630 3.5980
Product Bid Marathon, BP, Global, Husky, etc. Ultra Low Sulfur Premium Diesel Various

Name & Location of Refiner BP/Cleveland Huski/Marathon/PBF/Ports Cleve. Various

TRANSPORT DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS

Gasoline 7500 6500 7500
Diesel 6500 6500 7500
TANKWAGON DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS

Gasoline NO BID 250 250
Diesel NO BID 250 250
EXCEPTIONS None None None

City of Brecksville

October 2013



CONSORTIUM BID TABULATION:
SUPPLYING GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

(continued)

MANSFIELD OIL CO.
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

(Using Sample Data
Provided on Bid
Form)

LUKE OIL CO.
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

(Using Sample Data
Provided on Bid
Form)

RKA PETROLEUM CO.
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

(Using Sample Data
Provided on Bid
Form)

SANTMYER OIL CO.
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

(Using Sample Data
Provided on Bid
Form)

Price Differential (Add)

Total Cost/ Gallon

Price Differential (Add)

Total Cost/ Gallon

Price Differential (Add)

Total Cost/ Gallon

Price Differential (Add)

Total Cost/ Gallon

0.0419 3.5824 0.0618 3.6023 0.0829 3.6234 0.0450 3.5855
0.0812 3.6217 0.1483 3.6888 0.1484 3.6889 0.1000 3.6405
Premium Gas, 93 Octane with Ethanol 93 Octane w/ 10% Ethanol (CBOB) Premium E10 Gasoline Marathon Petroleum
Sunoco and Buckeye, Cleveland, OH Marathon, Brecksville (TBD Various) BP, Sunoco, Husky, Marathon Marathon Canton Refinery
0.0344 3.4203 0.0303 3.4162 0.0364 3.4223 0.0450 3.4309
0.0812 3.4671 0.1298 3.5157 0.1019 3.4878 0.1000 3.4859
Mid Grade, 89 Octane with Ethanol 89 Octane w/ 10% Ethanol (CBOB) Midgrade E10 Gasoline Marathon Petroleum
Sunoco and Buckeye, Cleveland, OH Marathon, Brecksville (TBD Various) BP, Sunoco, Husky, Marathon Marathon Canton Refinery
0.0204 3.2980 (0.0023) 3.2753 0.0016 3.2792 0.0450 3.3226
0.0812 3.3588 0.0973 3.3749 0.0678 3.3454 0.1000 3.3776
Regular Grade, 87 Octane with Ethanol 87 Octane w/ 10% Ethanol (CBOB) Regular E10 Gasoline Marathon Petroleum
Sunoco and Buckeye, Cleveland, OH Marathon, Brecksville (TBD Various) BP, Sunoco, Husky, Marathon Marathon Canton Refinery
(0.0025) 3.5325 0.0054 3.5404 (0.0242) 3.5108 0.0450 3.5800
0.1149 3.6499 0.1017 3.6367 0.0963 3.6313 0.1000 3.6350
Ultra Low Sulfur #2 Diesel #2ULS Diesel + .02/gal for winter add. #2 Clear Ultra Low Sulfure Diesel Sup. Marathon Petroleum
Sunoco and Buckeye, Cleveland, OH Marathon, Brecksville (TBD Various BP, Sunoco, Husky, Marathon Marathon Canton Refiner
7500 7000 4501 4500
7500 7000 4501 4500
1000 1000 100 250
1000 1000 100 250
None None None None

City of Brecksville

October 2013



City of North Royalton: Fuel Cost Comparison

10/25/2013 bid prices applied to our 2013 fuel orders to date.

Price/Gallon
Petroleum Traders
93 Octane 3.5504
ULS Diesel 3.5314
Ports Petroleum
93 Octane 3.5354
ULS Diesel 3.5299
RKA Petroleum
93 Octane 3.6234
ULS Diesel 3.5108

Gallons

39099
34152

39099
34152

39099
34152

$138,817.09
$120,604.37

$259,421.46

$138,230.60
$120,553.14

$258,783.75

$141,671.32
$119,900.84

$261,572.16
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