
 

June 2015 
Sunday  Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday 

 1 2  COUNCIL 7:30 
CAUCUS 7:15 
STREETS, STORM 
WATER, UTILITIES 
6:00 

3 
PLANNING 
COMMISSION 
7:00 
CAUCUS 6:45 

4 5 6 

7 8 
CIVIL SERVICE 
COMM 4:00  

9 10 11 12 13 

14 15 16 
COUNCIL 7:30 
CAUCUS 7:15 
B&BC, FINANCE 
AND SAFETY 6:00 

17 
PLANNING 
COMMISSION 
7:00 
CAUCUS 6:45 

18 19 20 

21 
FATHER’S DAY 

22 23 24 
BZA 7:00 
CAUCUS 6:45 

25 26 27 

28 29 30 
REC BOARD 
6:00 

    

All meetings will be held at City Hall 14600 State Road, unless otherwise noted. 
 
 



NORTH ROYALTON CITY COUNCIL 
A G E N D A 
JUNE 2, 2015 

 
7:15 p.m. Caucus Public Hearing and Council Meeting 7:30 p.m. 
 

 
PUBLIC HEARING 
 
 1. Call to Order. 
 
 2. Roll Call. 
 
 3. Public Hearing: 
 

A. APPLICATION SUBMITTED BY JOSEPH M. OLS FOR PLACEMENT OF 
APPROXIMATELY 7.5 ACRES OF LAND LOCATED AT 3148 WILTSHIRE ROAD IN 
THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON, PPN 486-26-006, IN AN AGRICULTURAL 
DISTRICT PURSUANT TO SECTION 929.02 OF THE OHIO REVISED CODE. 

 
 4. Adjournment. 
 

 
REGULAR ORDER OF BUSINESS 
 
 1. Call to Order. 
 
 2. Opening Ceremony (Pledge of Allegiance). 
 
 3. Roll Call. 
 
 4. Approval of Consent Agenda: Items listed under the Consent Agenda are considered routine. Each item 

will be read individually into the record and the Consent Agenda will then be enacted as a whole by 
one motion and one roll call. There will be no separate discussion of these items. If discussion by 
Council is desired on any Consent Agenda item, or if discussion is requested by the public on any 
legislative item on the Consent Agenda, that item will be removed from the Consent Agenda and 
considered in its normal sequence under the Regular Order of Business. 
 
a. Approval of Minutes: May 19, 2015. 
b. Authorize the Mayor and City Engineer to advertise for bids for the 2015 Road Program. 
c. Authorize the reduction of the sidewalk performance bond for Timberlane Estates Phase 4 

from $26,000 to $20,800 as approved by the City Engineer. 
d. Legislation: Introduce, suspend rules requiring 3 readings and referral to committee, and adopt 

those legislative items indicated with an asterisk (٭). 
 
 5. Communications. 
 
 6. Mayor's Report. 
 
 7. Department Head Reports. 
 
 8. President of Council's Report. 
 
 9. Committee Reports: 
 
 Building & Building Codes John Nickell 
 Finance Larry Antoskiewicz 
 Review & Oversight Dan Kasaris 
 Safety Dan Langshaw 
 Storm Water Steve Muller 
 Streets Paul Marnecheck 
 Utilities Gary Petrusky 
  
10. Report from Council Representatives to regulatory or other boards: 
 
 Board of Zoning Appeals Dan Kasaris 
 Planning Commission Larry Antoskiewicz 
 Recreation Board Paul Marnecheck 
 
11. Public Discussion: Five minute maximum, on current agenda legislation only. 
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12. LEGISLATION 

 
THIRD READING CONSIDERATION 
 
 1. 15-33 - AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO AN 

AGREEMENT WITH CUYAHOGA COUNTY, OHIO FOR THE CUYAHOGA COUNTY 
PROPERTY DEMOLITION PROGRAM, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. First 
reading March 3, 2015. Second reading March 17, 2015. 

 
 2. 15-50 - AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE OFFICIAL ZONING MAP BY CHANGING 

THE ZONING CLASSIFICATION OF PERMANENT PARCEL NO. 487-10-002/003 FROM 
ITS PRESENT RESIDENTIAL MULTI-FAMILY DISTRICT ZONING CLASSIFICATION 
TO SENIOR CITIZEN DISTRICT ZONING CLASSIFICATION AS REQUESTED BY 
PROPERTY OWNER PARMA COMMUNITY GENERAL HOSPITAL ASSOCIATION 
AND ROYALTON SENIOR LIVING, INC., AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. First 
reading April 21, 2015 and referred to Planning Commission and Building and Building 
Codes Committee. Second reading May 5, 2015. Building and Building Codes Committee 
recommended approval May 19, 2015. Planning Commission Public Hearing 
June 3, 2015. 

 
FIRST READING CONSIDERATION 
 
 A RESOLUTION ADOPTING THE DOCUMENT CONTAINING THE - 59-15 .1 ٭

ALTERNATIVE TAX BUDGET INFORMATION FOR THE CITY OF NORTH 
ROYALTON FOR THE FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING JANUARY 1, 2016, AND 
SUBMITTING THE SAME TO THE AUDITOR OF CUYAHOGA COUNTY, OHIO, AND 
DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. 

 
 AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE BID OF CARGILL INC., FOR ROAD SALT - 60-15 .2 ٭

WITH AN OPTIONAL SECOND AND THIRD YEAR RENEWAL FOR THE 2015-2016 
SEASON, AS THE LOWEST AND BEST BID, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY. 

 
13. Miscellaneous. 
 
14. Adjournment. 



 
 

 
 
RESOLUTION NO. 15-59 INTRODUCED BY:  Mayor Stefanik 
 

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING THE DOCUMENT CONTAINING THE ALTERNATIVE 
TAX BUDGET INFORMATION FOR THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON FOR THE 

FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING JANUARY 1, 2016, AND SUBMITTING THE SAME TO THE 
AUDITOR OF CUYAHOGA COUNTY, OHIO, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY 

 
WHEREAS: Pursuant to Ohio Revised Code Section 5705.281, the Cuyahoga County Budget Commission 

has waived the requirement that the City of North Royalton adopt a tax budget as provided 
under Ohio Revised Code Section 5705.28, and has required the City of North Royalton to 
provide Alternative Tax Budget Information in order for the Commission to perform its duties 
under law; and 

 
WHEREAS: The Director of Finance has prepared the Alternative Tax Budget Information for the City of 

North Royalton, Ohio for the fiscal year beginning January 1, 2016 including a Division of 
Taxes Levied, Statement of Fund Activity, Unvoted General Obligation Debt, and Voted Debt 
Outside the 10 Mill Limit; all of which will be submitted to the Auditor of Cuyahoga County. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON, 
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT: 
 
Section 1.  The Alternative Tax Budget Information of the City of North Royalton for the fiscal year 2016 has 
been prepared and submitted to Council, and the same is adopted and confirmed as the Alternative Tax 
Budget Information of the City of North Royalton for the fiscal year beginning January 1, 2016, a copy of said 
Alternative Tax Budget is attached hereto as Exhibit A and incorporated herein as if fully rewritten. 
 
Section 2.  The Director of Finance is hereby authorized and directed to forward a copy of the said Alternative 
Tax Budget Information and a copy of this Resolution to the Auditor of Cuyahoga County, Ohio. 
 
Section 3.  It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the 
adoption of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this 
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in 
compliance with all legal requirements. 
 
Section 4.  This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the 
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is 
immediately necessary to file the Alternative Tax Budget Information with the County Fiscal Officer on or 
before the 20th day of July according to law. 
 
THEREFORE, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to 
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor; 
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law. 
 
 
 
  APPROVED:      

PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL       MAYOR 
 

DATE PASSED:    DATE APPROVED:      
  

         
         
ATTEST:   
     DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES 
 
YEAS:  
  
 
NAYS:  
 



















 
 

 
 
ORDINANCE NO. 15-60 INTRODUCED BY:  Marnecheck, Antoskiewicz, Nickell 
 Langshaw 
 

AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE BID OF CARGILL INC., FOR ROAD SALT WITH 
AN OPTIONAL SECOND AND THIRD YEAR RENEWAL FOR THE 2015-2016 SEASON, 

AS THE LOWEST AND BEST BID, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY 
 
WHEREAS: The City of North Royalton may purchase road salt through its membership in the Joint 

Municipal Improvement Consortium (JMIC) at a lower rate than if it purchased it on the open 
market; and 

 
WHEREAS: The bids submitted to the JMIC were consistent with the competitive bidding requirements of 

the Ohio Revised Code and Charter of the City of North Royalton; and 
 
WHEREAS: Council wishes to accept the bid of Cargill Inc., for road salt for the 2015-2016 season. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON, 
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT: 
 
Section 1.  The 2015-2016 bid of Cargill Inc., through the Joint Municipal Improvement Consortium, for the 
supplying of salt for the Service Department of the City of North Royalton, with an optional second and third 
year renewal, as the primary source for bulk road salt as set forth in Exhibit A attached hereto and incorporated 
as if fully rewritten and which is in accordance with the specifications on file in the office of the Service 
Director, is hereby accepted as the lowest and best bid. 
 
Section 2.  The Mayor is hereby authorized and directed to enter into a contract on behalf of the City of North 
Royalton with Cargill Inc., as set forth in Section 1 hereof, said contract to be in such form as is approved by 
the Director of Law. 
 
Section 3.  The Service Director is hereby authorized and directed to forward a certified copy of this 
Ordinance to Cargill Inc. 
 
Section 4.  It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the 
adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this 
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in 
compliance with all legal requirements. 
 
Section 5.  This Ordinance is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the 
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is 
immediately necessary to provide for the purchase of bulk road salt for the City of North Royalton. 
 
THEREFORE, provided this Ordinance receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to 
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor; 
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law. 
 
 
 
  APPROVED:      

PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL       MAYOR 
 

DATE PASSED:    DATE APPROVED:      
  

         
         
ATTEST:   
     DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES 
 
YEAS:  
  
 
NAYS:  
 



 
    City of North Royalton  

 
 
 
 

Service Department 
440-582-3002 

fax 440-582-3089 
 
               

                                    
              

      Mayor Robert A. Stefanik 
 
 

     Nick Cinquepalmi 
    Service Director                                 

 

 
 

 

TO:    Streets Committee – Paul Marnecheck, Chairman 
            Larry Antoskiewicz, Vice Chair 
            John Nickell 

   
FROM:   Nick Cinquepalmi, Service Director 
 
DATE:   May 27, 2015 
 
RE:    2015-2016 Salt Bid Recommendation 
 
 
Please find attached the bid tally sheets and forms from the Consortium Bid Opening for the 
2015-2016 Salt Bid Program.  Also note the optional 2nd and 3rd year renewal included in the 
bid. 
 
I am recommending that the City of North Royalton accept the bid of Cargill, Inc as the lowest 
and best bid for the year 2015-2016, including the optional 2nd and 3rd year renewal.   
 
I request this bid recommendation be placed on Council Agenda June 2, 2015 meeting for 
approval.  If there are any questions, do not hesitate to contact me.  Thanks. 
 
 
/aca 
 
Encl. 
 
c:  Mayor Robert Stefanik 
 Laura Haller, Legislative Director 

File 
                                                                                                                                

            11545 Royalton Road  North Royalton, Ohio 44133  www.northroyalton.org 
 



 
 
__________________________________________________________________________________________ 
BID TABULATION:  Supplying Sodium Chloride  (November 1, 2015-November 1, 2016) 
 
Purchasing Consortium Cities:  Beachwood, Brecksville, Broadview Heights, Brooklyn, Brooklyn Heights, Cuyahoga County, Independence, 
Lakewood, Middleburg Heights, North Royalton, Seven Hills, Valley View 
 
Bid Opening:  Friday, May 15, 2015      9:00 a.m. 
 
Present:  Becki Riser, City of Brecksville;  Ron Weidig, City of Brecksville; Tony DiPietro, Cargill, Inc. 
 
 
PLANHOLDERS 

 
American Rock Salt Company    
Cargill, Inc. 

 Morton Salt, Inc. 
Compass Minerals 
 

 
KEY SUMMARY 
Cost for First Year, Untreated Sodium Chloride: 
        Per Ton, Dump Delivery   Per Ton, Piler Delivery 
 

AMERICAN ROCK SALT    No Bid      No Bid 
  

CARGILL, INC.     $56.29      $59.79 
 

MORTON SALT, INC.     $80.31      $83.31 
 
COMPASS MINERALS    $76.24      $80.18 
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CARGILL, INC.  
 
To supply in accordance with specifications, for a one-year period, the sum of: 
 
 
Cost for First Year (11/1/15 – 10/31/16), Untreated Sodium Chloride: 
    $56.29 Per Ton, Dump Delivery         $59.79 Per Ton, Piler Delivery 
 
 
Cost for First Year (11/1/15 – 10/31/16), Treated Sodium Chloride: 
    $67.03 Per Ton, Dump Delivery         $70.53 Per Ton, Piler Delivery 
 
 
 
Products Bid:       Sodium Chloride for Ice Control & Enhanced Clearlane Deicer         
 
 
Second and Third Year Optional Extensions:  Yes 
 
 
Guaranteed Delivery Within 24-72 Hours?          Yes 
 
 
Minimum Order?     Yes………Quantity: 25 Tons /Dump   300 Tons/Piler  
 
 
Exceptions:  None. 
 
 
 
Name & Address of Bidder: 
Cargill Incorporated Deicing Technology Business Unit 
24950 Country Club blvd., Suite 450 
North Olmsted, OH  44070 
Phone:  800-600-7258  Fax:  888-739-8705 
   
Contact: Tamara Roy, Customer Solutions Specialist 
  tamara_roy@cargill.com 
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MORTON SALT, INC. 
 
To supply in accordance with specifications, for a one-year period, the sum of: 
 
 
Cost for First Year (11/1/15 – 10/31/16), Untreated Sodium Chloride: 
    $80.31 Per Ton, Dump Delivery         $83.31 Per Ton, Piler Delivery 
 
 
Cost for First Year (11/1/15 – 10/31/16), Treated Sodium Chloride: 
    No Bid            No Bid 
 
 
 
Products Bid:         Untreated Sodium Chloride  (Morton Safe-T-Salt)         
 
 
Second and Third Year Optional Extensions:  Yes, based on mutual agreement 
 
 
Guaranteed Delivery Within 24-72 Hours?      1 – 5 Days ARO 
 
 
Minimum Order?     Yes…….Quantity:  20 Tons /Dump  200 Tons/Piler  
 
 
Exceptions:       Morton Salt, Inc. is willing to extend the contract for 2015-2016 based on mutual agreement. 
 
     Morton Salt, Inc. guarantees 1-5 delivery days ARO. 
 
 
Name & Address of Bidder: 
Morton Salt, Inc. 
Ice Control Marketing 
123 N. Wacker Drive 
Chicago, IL  60606-1743 
Phone:  855-665-4540  Fax:  312-807-2669 
 
Contact:   Anthony Patton/Leah Pittacora 
  Director, US Gov’t Bulk Deicing Sales & Mktg/Project Manager Ice Control Salt Group 
  buyroadsalt@mortonsalt.com 
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COMPASS MINERALS 
 
To supply in accordance with specifications, for a one-year period, the sum of: 
 
Cost for First Year (11/1/15 – 10/31/16), Untreated Sodium Chloride: 
    $76.24 Per Ton, Dump Delivery         $80.18 Per Ton, Piler Delivery 
 
 
Cost for First Year (11/1/15 – 10/31/16), Treated Sodium Chloride: 
    No Bid     No Bid 
 
 
Products Bid:         Sodium Chloride treated with (YPS) Yellow Prussiate of Soda 
 
 
Second and Third Year Optional Extensions:  No 
 
 
Guaranteed Delivery Within 24-72 Hours?     No 
 
 
Minimum Order?     Yes……. Quantity:    20-25 Tons/Dump                200 Tons /Piler  
 
 
Exceptions:         -Quote is binding for (30) days after May 9, 2015. 
     -CMP will not be able to accept a secondary or back-up award. 
     -The City agrees to purchase 80% of the base bid amount of 72,000 tons, and 
            CMP agrees to provide up to 100% of the base bid amount. 
     -The City agrees not to take any tons prior to July 1, 2015. 
     -The City agrees to take delivery of the 80% minimum on or before March 31, 2016 
            (Please understand that CMP is unable to carry over any inventory at our depot.)  
     -Contract expires on April 30, 2016. 
 
Name & Address of Bidder: 
Compass Minerals America, Inc. 
9900 West 109th Street 
Overland Park, KS  66210 
Phone:  800-323-1641 
 
Contact:  Doug Dyer 
dyerd@compassminerals.com 
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HISTORICAL PRICING FOR PURCHASING CONSORTIUM: 
 
 
Year   Awarded Bidder   Price for Untreated Sodium Chloride – Dump Delivery    
 
2000   Cargill Salt, Inc.    $ 22.25   
 
2001   Cargill Salt, Inc.    $ 27.98 
 
2002   Cargill Salt, Inc.    $ 29.43 
 
2003/04  Cargill Salt, Inc.    $ 30.68 
 
2004/05  Cargill Salt, Inc.    $ 30.35 
 
2005/06  Cargill Salt, Inc.  (Extension) $ 31.45  
 
2006/07  Cargill Salt, Inc.    $ 32.97 
 
2007/08  Cargill Salt, Inc.  (Extension) $ 34.22 
 
2008/09  Cargill Salt, Inc.    $ 41.06 
 
2009/10  Cargill Salt, Inc.  (Extension) $ 47.21 
 
2010/11  Cargill Salt, Inc.  (Extension) $ 47.21 
 
2011/12  Cargill Salt, Inc.    $ 47.97 
 
2012/13  Cargill Salt, Inc.  (Extension) $ 47.97 
 
2013/14  Cargill Salt, Inc.    $45.38 
 
2014/15  Cargill Salt, Inc.  (Extension) $49.39 
 
 
 
Apparent Low Bidder: 
 
2015/16  Cargill Salt, Inc.   $56.29  
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